
4/27/22, 12:04 PM Blairstone Forest HOA Mail - Fw: Nichols Stahlco Line Pump Quote

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=d3d715cf40&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1729318163905311128%7Cmsg-f%3A1729318163… 1/1

Blairstone Forest <info@blairstoneforesthoa.com>

Fw: Nichols Stahlco Line Pump Quote 
1 message

Churchard Photography <ace1photo@yahoo.com> Tue, Apr 5, 2022 at 8:54 PM
Reply-To: Churchard Photography <ace1photo@yahoo.com>
To: Margaret Stephens <tenismar@live.com>, Blairstone Forest <info@blairstoneforesthoa.com>

This was for discussion tonight and I thought I forwarded this to you all for review beforehand. At least you get a week to
look at the below estimate, sorry 'bout that!

Happy Reading :(

Thanks,
Tracie

----- Forwarded Message -----
From: Mark Turcotte <mark.nicholsstahlco@gmail.com>
To: "ace1photo@yahoo.com" <ace1photo@yahoo.com>
Sent: Monday, March 28, 2022, 02:45:01 PM EDT
Subject: Nichols Stahlco Line Pump Quote

Hello Tracie,  

I hope all is well.  This email will serve as an official quote, good for 30 days, to perform your grout pumping service out to
the gazebo to fill the whole under the gazebo as discussed in our meeting.  Below is a list of how our rates are
calculated...

Line Pump base rate is $175 per hr with a 3 hr on site minimum.
With the amount of line needed to complete the job there will be an extra $75 per hr for an extra man.
$4 per yard pumped
1 hr min travel charge
Because you are basically self performing this task, I feel the need to be present on site during the process to help guide
and properly communicate things at $75 per hr.
+ 10 % fuel surcharge of the total   

I wanted to remind you that even though you had someone look at the void, it could potentially take more than the
estimated 5 or 6 yards of material and I think it would be wise to be prepared for more material if necessary.  

Using the above rates I can attempt to estimate how much this will cost... 4 hrs on site, 6 yrds of material, 1 hr travel
charge along with the extra labor.  $1652.20  Again, this is only an estimate and if we end up having to pump more
material we will be there longer, therefore costing more.

I hope this helps and if you have any questions, feel free to contact me.

Kind Regards, 

--  
Mark Turcotte
Branch Manager
Nichols StahlCo LLC
850-562-3239 office
205-565-9299 cell
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